
1. WASTE REMOVAL BEST WAY RUMPKE

Container/ Pickup Frequency  Total Per Month  Total Per Month 

Beechgrove Elementary 1 - 8yd, 5X/WK 303.10$                       545.58$                   

Caywood Elementary 1 - 8yd, 5X/WK 303.10$                       545.58$                   

Ft. Wright Elementary 1 - 6yd, 5X/WK 244.21$                       422.18$                   

Hinsdale Elementary 1 - 8yd, 5X/WK 303.10$                       545.58$                   

Kenton Elementary 1 - 8yd, 5X/WK 303.10$                       545.58$                   

Piner Elementary 1 - 6yd, 5X/WK 244.21$                       422.18$                   

River Ridge Elementary 1 - 8yd, 5X/WK 303.10$                       545.58$                   

Ryland Heights Elementary 2 - 6yd, 3X/WK 293.05$                       253.31$                   

Taylor Mill Elementary 1 - 8yd, 5X/WK 303.10$                       545.58$                   

White’s Tower Elementary 1 - 6yd, 5X/WK 244.21$                       422.18$                   

Summit View Middle 1 - 8yd, 5X/WK 69.36$                         545.58$                   

1 - 6yd, 5X/WK 244.21$                       422.18$                   

1 - 2yd, 3X/WK 303.10$                       123.41$                   

Summit View Elementary 2 - 6yd, 5X/WK 488.42$                       422.18$                   

Turkey Foot Middle 1 - 8yd, 5X/WK 303.10$                       545.58$                   

Twenhofel Middle 2 - 2yd, 2X/WK 46.24$                         82.27$                      

1 - 4yd, 5X/WK 231.22$                       324.75$                   

1 - 8yd, 5X/WK 303.10$                       545.58$                   

Woodland Middle School 1 - 8yd, 5X/WK 303.10$                       545.58$                   

Dixie Heights High School 1 - 8yd, 5X/WK 606.20$                       545.58$                   

Scott High School 1 - 6yd, 2X/WK 97.68$                         166.87$                   

1 - 8yd, 5X/WK 303.10$                       545.58$                   

Simon Kenton High School 1 - 4yd, 2X/WK 92.48$                         129.90$                   

1 - 6yd, 2X/WK 97.68$                         166.87$                   

1 - 8yd, 5X/WK 606.20$                       545.58$                   

The Academies 1 - 4yd, 1X/WK 46.24$                         64.95$                      

1 - 30yd, On-Call 360.00$                       425.00$                   

KCBOE South 1 - 8yd, 1X/WK 60.62$                         109.12$                   

Transportation Office 1 - 2yd, 2X/WK 23.12$                         82.27$                      
Montly Subtotal 7,429.45$                    11,132.16$              
Annual Sub-total 89,153.40$                  133,585.92$           

Total Points

2. ADDITIONAL PICK-UP SERVICE (As Needed) BEST WAY RUMPKE
 Price Per Pick up  Price Per Pick up 

2 Yard Container 23.12$                         60.00$                      
4 yard Container 38.00$                         60.00$                      
6 Yard Container 50.00$                         60.00$                      
8 Yard Container 60.00$                         60.00$                      
30 Yard Roll-Off 360.00$                       425.00$                   

Total 531.12$                       665.00$                   

BEST WAY RUMPKE
 Price Per Pick up  Price Per Pick up 

2 yard3 container - 1 pick-up/week 23.12$                         41.14$                      
2 yard3 container - 2 pick-up/week 46.24$                         82.27$                      
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3. CHANGES TO CURRENT CONFIGURATIONS

OVERALL COST
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2 yard3 container - 3 pick-up/week 69.36$                         123.41$                   
2 yard3 container - 4 pick-up/week 92.48$                         No Bid
2 yard3 container - 5 pick-up/week 115.60$                       No Bid
4 yard3 container - 1 pick-up/week 46.24$                         64.95$                      
4 yard3 container - 2 pick-up/week 92.48$                         129.90$                   
4 yard3 container - 3 pick-up/week 138.72$                       194.85$                   
4 yard3 container - 4 pick-up/week 184.96$                       No Bid
4 yard3 container - 5 pick-up/week 231.20$                       No Bid
6 yard3 container - 1 pick-up/week 50.00$                         84.44$                      
6 yard3 container - 2 pick-up/week 97.68$                         168.87$                   
6 yard3 container - 3 pick-up/week 146.52$                       253.31$                   
6 yard3 container - 4 pick-up/week 195.36$                       No Bid
6 yard3 container - 5 pick-up/week 244.21$                       No Bid
8 yard3 container - 1 pick-up/week 60.62$                         109.12$                   
8 yard3 container - 2 pick-up/week 120.00$                       218.24$                   
8 yard3 container - 3 pick-up/week 181.86$                       327.36$                   
8 yard3 container - 4 pick-up/week 242.48$                       436.48$                   
8 yard3 container - 5 pick-up/week 303.10$                       No Bid

Total 2,682.23$                    2,234.34$                

4. CORRUGATE CARDBOARD RECYCLING BEST WAY RUMPKE

Container/ Pickup Frequency  Total Per Month  Total Per Month 
Ft. Wright Elementary 1 - 8yd, 1X/WK, Front Load 51.96$                         95.00$                      
Hinsdale Elementary 1 - 8yd, 1X/WK, Front Load 51.96$                         95.00$                      
Kenton Elementary 1 - 8yd, 1X/WK, Front Load 51.96$                         95.00$                      
White’s Tower Elementary 1 - 6yd, 1X/WK, Front Load 38.67$                         70.00$                      
Dixie Heights High School 1 - 8yd, 1X/WK, Front Load 51.96$                         95.00$                      

Montly Total 246.51$                       450.00$                   

5. ADDITIONAL CORRUGATED CARDBOARD BEST WAY RUMPKE
 Price per Pickup  Total Per Month 

96-Gal Cart 15.75$                         No Bid
2 yard3 20.00$                         10.00$                      
4 yard3 26.00$                         12.00$                      
6 yard3 38.97$                         17.00$                      
8 yard3 51.96$                         22.00$                      

Montly Total 136.93$                       61.00$                      

6. CO-MINGLING WASTE RECYCLING BEST WAY RUMPKE
 Price per Pickup  Total Per Month 

1-Pickup 15.75$                         16.00$                      
2-Pickup 31.50$                         No Bid
3-Pickup 47.25$                         No Bid
4-Pickup 63.00$                         No Bid
5-Pickup 78.75$                         No Bid

Montly Total 220.50$                       16.00$                      

96-Gal Roll Out Container Monthly Rental Cost Included $3.50

Total for All Services Listed Above 92,970.69$                  137,012.26$           
60.00 31.58Total Points Awarded for Overall Cost
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Perceived Quality of Service BEST WAY RUMPKE
Evaluator 1 4.00 10.00
Evaluator 2 6.00 9.00
Evaluator 3 3.00 9.00

Average Score 4.33 9.33
8.67 18.67

68.67 50.24

= Recommended as the best evaluated bid

Total Points for Cost and Perceived Quality of Serivce

Total Points Awarded for Perceived Quality of Service 

QUALITY OF SERVICE AND QUALIFICATIONS

*Due to Best Way being being greater than 10 points ahead of the Rumpke, references were not 
contacted and included in the evaluation. 
*Best Way is the current contract holder for the District. 



Evaluator 1 Evaluator 2 Evaluator 3 Avg Score Points Awarded
Quality of Service Write-Up 4 6 3 4.33 8.67

Evaluator 1 Evaluator 2 Evaluator 3 Avg Score Points Awarded
Quality of Service Write-Up 10 9 9 9.33 18.67

Waste Removal and Recycling
Perceived Quality of Service 

Best Way 

Rumpke
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