THE KENTON COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT FUEL AND FUEL OIL 2021-2022

380,000 25,000	# 0.025	9,500.00	# 0.0664		Unit Price MINUS	Total	Unit Price	Total
	0.025	9,500.00		25 222 00	MINUS		_	
	0.025	9,500.00		25 222 00	MINUS	i i	+	
		9,500.00	0.0664					
25,000	0.1			25,232.00	0.0019	-722.00	0	0.00
25,000	0.1							
	0.1	2,500.00	0.01		MINUS .0126	-315.00	0.12	3,000.00
		12,000.00		25,482.00		-1,037.00		3,000.00
	+							
1,200	0.25	300.00	No	Bid	No	Bid	No	Bid
, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,								
3,000	1.8082	5,424.60	2.4059	7,217.70	1.8834	5,650.20	1.8006	5,401.80
140	1.8906	264.68	2.4059	336.83	1.8834	263.68	1.8006	252.08
		5,689.28		7,554.53		5,913.88		5,653.88
	No	ľ				""		
1	Addendum		0.00	0.00	1500.00	1,500.00	0.00	0.00
3			0.00	0.00	700.00	2,100.00	0.00	0.00
12			14.00	168.00		180.00	0.00	0.00
4			250.00	1,000.00	800.00	800.00	0.00	0.00
8				0.00	70.00	560.00	0.00	0.00
				1,168.00		5,140.00		0.00
		<u> </u>				<u> </u>		
		ļ.,				ļ		
	\$75.00		\$150.00		\$100.00		\$0.00	
		Unable to tab						
		9						
				\$34 708 53		\$10 016 88		\$8,653.88
	3,000 140 1	3,000 1.8082 140 1.8906 No 1 Addendum 3 12 4 8 3,000 \$50.00 \$75.00	**************************************	+ 1,200 0.25 300.00 No 3,000 1.8082 5,424.60 2.4059 140 1.8906 264.68 2.4059 5,689.28 2.4059 1 Addendum 0.00 1 Addendum 0.00 1 12 14.00 4 250.00 8 3,000 5,000 \$75.00 \$75.00 \$75.00 \$150.00 Unable to tab due to missing	+ 1,200 0.25 300.00 No Bid 3,000 1.8082 5,424.60 2.4059 7,217.70 140 1.8906 264.68 2.4059 336.83 5,689.28 7,554.53 No 1 Addendum 0.00 0.00 3 0.00 0.00 12 14.00 168.00 4 250.00 1,000.00 8 0 0.00 3,000 5,000 3,000 5,000 \$75.00 \$75.00 \$75.00 \$150.00 Unable to tab due to missing	1,200 0.25 300.00 No Bid No 3,000 1.8082 5,424.60 2.4059 7,217.70 1.8834 140 1.8906 264.68 2.4059 336.83 1.8834 5,689.28 7,554.53 No 1 Addendum 0.00 0.00 1500.00 12 14.00 168.00 15.00 14 2 250.00 1,000.00 800.00 18 2 250.00 1,000.00 800.00 1,168.00 5,000 1,168.00 1,168.00 Unable to tab due to missing Unable to tab due to missing	1,200 0.25 300.00 No Bid No Bi	1,200 0.25 300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No A No Bid No

Recommended as the lowest and/or best evaluated bid -

Notes: James River is non-compliant on a portion of the bid due to a missing bid document: Addendum #1.

Addendum #1 was necessary for tabulating the unleaded gasoline and evaluating the tank monitoring system. JRS is the only bidder for option #1B. However, several locations were investigated and no acceptable locations were located.

^{*}The current vendor installed tank monitors at no cost to the district and there are no monthly charges associated with the monitors.