KENTON COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Lawn Mowing, Weed Control, Bush Hogging Bid Tabulation

Precise Fender's
Jr's Lawncare Lawn Care GreensKeeper's  TruGreen
LAWN MOWING
Dixie Heights
Cost per Mow $525.00 No Bid $630.00 No Bid
Price Points 90.00“ 72.00
Referene Score 7.00 6.00
Dixie Total Score 97.00]| 0.00 78.00
Ft. Wright Elementary
Cost per Mow $152.00| $128.00]| $230.00 No Bid
Price Points 73.13“ 90.00“ 18.28
Referene Score 7.00 10.00, 6.00
Ft. Wright Total Score 80.13]| 100.00|| 24.28
R.C. Hinsdale Elementary
Cost per Mow $390.00|| $314.00]| $425.00 No Bid
Price Points 68.22“ 90.00“ 58.18
Referene Score 7.00 10.00, 6.00
R.C. Hinsdale Total Score 75.22| 100.00|| 64.18
River Ridge Elementary
Cost per Mow $300.00 $225.00(| $185.00|| No Bid
Price Points 34.05 70.54“ 90.00“
Referene Score 7.00 10.00 6.00
River Ridge Total Score 41.05 80.54]| 96.00||
Turkey Foot/Caywood Campus
Cost per Mow $625.00| $498.00]| $500.00 No Bid
Price Points 67.05“ 90.00“ 89.64
Referene Score 7.00 10.00, 6.00
Turkey Foot/Caywood Total Score 74.05| 100.00|| 95.64
Beechgrove Elementary
Cost per Mow $290.00|| $214.00]| $215.00 No Bid
Price Points 58.04“ 90.00“ 89.58
Referene Score 7.00 10.00, 6.00
Beechgrove Total Score 65.04] 100.00|| 95.58
Piner Elementary
Cost per Mow $200.25 No Bid $200.00 No Bid
Price Points 89.89 90.00
Referene Score 7.00 6.00
Piner Total Score 96.89)| 0.00 96.00
Simon Kenton/Kenton Campus
Cost per Mow $1,305.25 No Bid $1,200.00| No Bid
Price Points 82.11 90.00“
Referene Score 7.00 6.00
Simon Kenton/Kenton Total Score 89.11 0.00 96.00||
Summit View Academy
Cost per Mow $807.25 $598.00]| $800.00 No Bid
Price Points 58.51 90.00| 59.60
Referene Score 7.00 10.00“ 6.00



KENTON COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Lawn Mowing, Weed Control, Bush Hogging Bid Tabulation

Precise Fender's
Jr's Lawncare Lawn Care GreensKeeper's  TruGreen
Summit View Total Score 65.51] 100.00(| 65.60
Twenhofel Middle & Bus Lot
Cost per Mow $1,255.75 $1,098.00| $1,195.00 No Bid
Price Points 77.07 90.00“ 82.05
Referene Score 7.00 10.00, 6.00
Twenhofel/Bus Lot Total Score 84.07" 100.00|| 88.05
Ryland Heights Elementary
Cost per mow $275.00(| $219.00|| $275.00 No Bid
Price Points 66.99“ 90.00“ 66.99
Referene Score 7.00 10.00, 6.00
Ryland Heights Total Score 73.99" 100.00|| 72.99
Scott/Woodland Campus
Cost per Mow $940.00(| $860.00|| $950.00 No Bid
Price Points 81.63“ 90.00“ 80.58
Referene Score 7.00 10.00, 6.00
Scott/Woodland Total Score 88.63)| 100.00| 86.58
Taylor Mill Elementary
Cost per Mow $245.00(| $165.00|| $170.00 No Bid
Price Points 46.36“ 90.00“ 87.27
Referene Score 7.00 10.00, 6.00
Ryland Heights Total Score 53.36" 100.00|| 93.27
White's Tower Elementary
Cost per Mow $250.00(| $220.00|| $250.00 No Bid
Price Points 77.73“ 90.00“ 77.73
Referene Score 7.00 10.00, 6.00
White's Tower Total Score 84.73" 100.00|| 83.73

*Awarding by individual school, will save the district an annual estimated amount of $14,124.00

|| || = Recommended as the best evaluated bid




KENTON COUNTY SCHOOL DISTRICT
Lawn Mowing, Weed Control, Bush Hogging Bid Tabulation

FERTILIZATION

Beechgrove Elementary

Ft. Wright Elementary

R.C. Hinsdale Elementary

Piner Elementary

River Ridge Elementary

Ryland Heights Elementary

Taylor Mill Elementary

White’s Tower Elementary

Summit View Academy

Turkey Foot Middle/ Caywood Elementary Campus
Twenhofel Middle

Dixie Heights High

Scott High/ Woodland Middle Campus

Simon Kenton High / Kenton Elementary Campus

ROUND-UP APPLICATION

Beechgrove Elementary

Ft. Wright Elementary

R.C. Hinsdale Elementary

Piner Elementary

River Ridge Elementary

Ryland Heights Elementary

Taylor Mill Elementary

White’s Tower Elementary

Summit View Academy

Turkey Foot Middle/ Caywood Elementary Campus
Twenhofel Middle

Dixie Heights High

Scott High/ Woodland Middle Campus

Simon Kenton High / Kenton Elementary Campus

Hourly Rates
Hourly Rate for additional weed/fertilization treatment
Material Rate for additional weed/fertilization treatment

Hourly rate for additional Round-up treatment
Material Rate for additional Round-up treatment

Jr's Lawncare

No BID
No BID
No BID
No BID
No BID
No BID
No BID
No BID
No BID
No BID
No BID
No BID
No BID
No BID

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Precise
Lawn Care

No BID
No BID
No BID
No BID
No BID
No BID
No BID
No BID
No BID
No BID
No BID
No BID
No BID
No BID

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

Fender's
GreensKeepers TruGreen

No BID S 125.00
No BID S 70.00
No BID S 115.00
No BID S 55.00
No BID S 250.00
No BID S 80.00
No BID S 75.00
No BID S 150.00
No BID S 500.00
No BID S 300.00
No BID S 925.00
No BID S 190.00
No BID S 500.00
No BID S 280.00
No Bid S 100.00
No Bid S 100.00
No Bid S 150.00
No Bid S 100.00
No Bid S 225.00
No Bid S 100.00
No Bid S 100.00
No Bid S 125.00
No Bid S 350.00
No Bid S 350.00
No Bid S 380.00
No Bid S 300.00
No Bid S 350.00
No Bid S 400.00
No Bid S 40.00
No Bid S 3.00
No Bid S 40.00
No Bid S 3.00

| =Recommended as the best evaluated bid
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Precise Fender's
Jr's Lawncare Lawn Care GreensKeepers TruGreen

BUSH HOGGING

Group #1

R.C. Hinsdale Elementary No Bid No Bid S 650.00 No Bid
Turkey Foot Middle/Caywood Elementary Campus No Bid No Bid S 700.00 No Bid
Group #2

Beechgrove Elementary No Bid No Bid S 400.00 No Bid
Twenhofel Middle No Bid No Bid S 600.00 No Bid
Simon Kenton High/Kenton Elementary No Bid No Bid S 450.00 No Bid
Summit View Academy No Bid No Bid S 560.00 No Bid
Group #3

Ryland Heights Elementary No Bid No Bid S 250.00 No Bid
Scott High/Woodland Middle Campus No Bid No Bid S 370.00 No Bid

= Recommended as the best evaluated bid
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